IR WY TR HRURTH forfics

(So%0 WRBR BT SUsHA)
U.P. Power Corporation Limited

(U.P. Government Undertaking)
| CIN: U32201UP1999SGC024928 | GSTN: 09AAACU5088M4ZM |

BRIRC ST (TrﬁT\‘fﬁ '\Q'ﬂ) Corporate Tax (GST Cell)

D G- 320, i[cﬁﬂ e, ¥Ifdd Haw, 14—mNe AN, TETS—226001, A - dgmtaxuppcl@gmail.com
Room No.— 320, IlIrd Floor, Shakti Bhawan, 14-Ashok Marg, Lucknow-226001, RAX — 8320,

ERC

Bl

fesr-fder Wo: /@10 oy ud Sfiousodio Aol /2024 / fesia: o] / 93/ 2024
T 3eReT AT Sfter,
J0Y0 UTaR HRUNE fRio, Jfer wgeaquf

favg— Consequences of PAN becoming inoperative as per the newly substituted rule 114AAA
® e |

HUIT IWIFT 90 & T4 § D W (CBDT) §RT i feem—fader o 03 of 2023 Dated
28th March, 2023 &1 a4 T80 &N, oI Aregd 3 Consequences of PAN becoming inoperative as
per the newly substituted rule 114AAA fayga feen—Fder SR {0 1 & | R IR Individual
TDS deductees/TCS collectees @ MR U9 ¥ fofg 8T &, S99 U9 faidv 01.07.2023 A Inoperative ®X
[ T 2 Vd Mg AT, 1961 DI GRT 206AA/206CC & T “Inoperative PAN” TR MR
e TR A AoSlowHo e / AoAloTdo FURT B BT Waem 2 |

SWIad & e 4 Fag & & W arell &1 sruier (e ufem @ awa & fear o
[l B

1. SAP R g&18dl R el &I auells &vd W,

2. Invoices WX aO?:ﬁOWO qRa deel 4y,

3 aRa /e B g 3 A )

Jdd @ ATelld H iﬁ% 4R Statutory Compliance ¥ FFRIT 7, 31d: U] f1q 5_31 [CRIBSIG]
g b SRigq ufbar & w9y 3mad MEFRM, 1961 ®1 GRT 206AA/206CC (“Inoperative PAN”) TR
aftra < A AoSlovdo e /Sodlovdo WIfRd T & Wifde=l &7 srure gRRad o |

el dh—

(1) Circular No. 03 of 2023 dated 28 March, 2023,

(1)) Copy of Section 114AAA of Income Tax Act,1961,

(ii1) Copy of Section 206AA of Income Tax Act,1961,

(iv) Copy of Section 206CC of Income Tax Act,1961, /
(G FHR)

9

ECRC]

Rer-fider 4 /@0 2ew 1@ Shovwodio W /2024 / TRl

yfaferfy ffaftaa a1 qamel vd smawe s 8g it
1. we fQed @ fon e, serad / gataer / ulawiad / sféomae faea faawer fm folo / ava!
AETS / IRIVRA /3RS /SR / B |
2. IR MY @ ol wfed, S0 9o IR BRURT folo, Wfad wae oRaws, |

PCL/2024/64



feve (fdw), wediad / qafad / aRaiae / fiorae figa faaxe frm o /s aa@me /
IRIVR /ARG /TR /BHGR 6T 39 M @ e M f 3 oo ood & "R w® 3 @
feem{faer il ¥ Td Billing Software ¥ Inoperative PAN TR €IRT 206CC & IRR 3RS
X ¥ Aovlogwo ARG HT GRRaT |

g gxe, B0 Y0 WX SRS oXe, Wfdd WaH, oS |

U HRIeEd (AR yawe), uReH oEl drafery, FRMR oae; Bl 59 dN™ @ 6 fb sgR
IR gHIgal DI TETUR Gl e ghfad &

U WEIYEHED (cle YR / HRURS of@r /fAfer /\wien) S0 %o urR eRuReH fon, wfdd waw
TGS, |

3eferor T (3MS0210), IR—TUISIIRYT UIe—v, B0 W0 Uik SRURYH fof0, SIfe Wa, ofae |
IRfad (W0 Yo @), S0 Y0 UIR HRUNYH fefo, WfdeT 7a, olveias |

AGIRENl Dld YIAN YIS /IqT Td ofeT/WeHd  oeifiien), NogHoge §0 W0 UTeR
SRURIE  felo, oiferT ¥aw, eS|

fereeiY S, daRse, JoWo UIaR BRURYA folo, w9 0 409, el Tt Wk Wad B deAST
TR YA T B |

______ | ol

(GINEREEICE)
SUHEIYEHS (CF)
*l¢ .

PCL/2024/65



Download Source: www.laxcorner.co.in

Circular No. 03 0f 2023

F. No. 370142/14/2022-TPL
sovernment of India
Ministry of Finance

: Department of Revenue

Central Board of Direct Taxes

REEEE

New Delhi, Dated the 2% of March, 2023

Sub.: Consequences of PAN becoming inoperative as per the newly substituted rule
114AAA —reg.
Consequent to the notification substituting rule 114AAA of the Income-tax Rules, 1962 (the

Rules) vide notification no. 15 of 2023 dated 28" March, 2023, it is hereby clarified that a

person who has failed to intimate the Aadhaar number in accordance with section 139AA of

the Income-tax Act, 1961 (the Act) read with rule 114AAA shall face the following
consequences as 4 result of his PAN becoming inoperative:
(i) refund of'any amount of tax or part thereof, due under the provisions of the Act shall
not be made to him;
the date specified under sub-rule (4) of rule 1 l4AAA and ending with the date on which
1t becomes operative;
(ii1) where tax is deductible under Chapter XVII-B in case of such person, such tax shatl
be deducted at higher rate, in accordance with the provisions of section 206AA;
(iv) where tax is collectible at source under Chapter XVII-BB in case of such person,
such tax shall be collected at higher rate, in accordance with the provisions of section
206CC,
2. These consequences shall take effect from 1% July, 2023 and continue till the PAN becomes
operative. A fee of one thousand rupees will continue to apply to make the PAN operative by

intimating the Aadhaar number.

3. The consequences of PAN becoming inoperative shall not be applicable to those persons

who have been provided exemption from intimating Aadhaar number under the provisions of

sub-section (3) of section 139AA of the Act.

Download Source: www. taxcorner.codn



Download Source:

www.taxcorner.co.in

Circular No. 03 0f 2023

4. This is in supersession of the Circular No. 07 of 2022 of CBDT dated 30 March, 2022.

5. Hindi version to follow.

Copy to:

A\
! by

P. Amrutha varshini

Under Secretary (TPL-1V), CBDT

1. PS to FM/ OSD to FM/ PS to MoS(F)/ PS to MoS(F)

2. OSD to Secretary (Revenue)

All Pr. DGSIT/ Pr. CCsIT

no W

CBDT
The C&AG of India

© e A

Chairman, CBDT & All Members, CBDT

PCIT (M&TP), Official Spokesperson of CBDT

All Joint Secretaries/ CsIT/ Directors/ Deputy Secretaries/ Under Secretaries of

The JS & Legal Adviser, Ministry of Law & Justice, New Delhi

Web manager, ADG (S)-4, O/o Pr. DGIT (Systems) for uploading on official website.

10. JCIT (Database Cell) for uploading on www.irsofficersonline.gov.in

Download Source:

www.taxcorner.co.in



2/28/24, 11:42 AM Income Tax Department

Income Tax Department

Government of India

Quoting of Aadhaar number.

139AA. (1) Every person who is cligible to obtain Aadhaar number shall, on or after the 1st day of July, 2017,
quote Aadhaar number—

(#) in the application form for allotment of permanent account number;
(i) in the return of income:

Provided that where the person does not possess the Aadhaar Number, the Enrolment ID of Aadhaar
application form issued to him at the time of enrolment shall be quoted in the application for permancnt
account number or, as the case may be, in the return of income furnished by him.

(2) Every person who has been allotted permanent account number as on the 1st day of July, 2017, and who is
cligible to obtain Aadhaar number, shall intimate his Aadhaar number to such authority in such form and

manner as may be prescribed, on or before a date to be notifiedZ2 by the Central Government in the Official
Gazette:

Provided that in casc of failure to intimate the Aadhaar number, the permanent account number allotted to the
person shall be made inoperative after the date so notified in such manner as may be prescribedZ8,

(3) The provisions of this section shall not apply to such person or class or classes of persons or any State or
part of any State, as may be notified by the Central Government in this behalf, in the Official Gazette.
Iixplanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expressions—

(i) "Aadhaar number", "Enrolment" and "resident" shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to
them in clauses (@), (m) and (v) of section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and other
Subsidics, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 (18 of 2016);

(i) "Enrolment ID" means a 28 digit Enrolment Identification Number issued to a resident at the time of
cnrolment.

about:blank



10/19/23, 3:26 PM Income Tax Department

Income Tax Department

Government of India

672‘[Manner of making permanent account number inoperative.

114AAA. Where a person, who has been allotted the permanent account number as on the 1st day of July,

2017 and is required to intimate his Aadhaar number under sub-section (2) of section 13944, has failed to

intimate the same on or before the 31st day of March, 2022, the permanent account number of such person
shall become inoperative, and he shall be liable for payment of fee in accordance with sub-rule (5A4) of rule

114.

(2) Where the person referred to in sub-rule (1) has intimated his Aadhaar number under sub-section (2) of
section 13944 afier the 31st day of March, 2022, after payment of fee in accordance with sub-rule (54) of
rule 114, his permanent account number shall become operative within thirty days from the date of
intimation of Aadhaar number.

*(3) A person, whose permanent account number has become inoperative, shall be liable for further
consequences for the period commencing from the date as specified under sub-rule (4) till the date it
becomes operative, namely:-

() refund of any amount of tax or part thereof, due under the provisions of the Act shall not be made;
(1) interest shall not be payable on such refund for the period, beginning with the date specified under
sub-rule (4) and ending with the date on which it becomes operative;
(i) where tax is deductible under Chapter XVIIB in case of such person, such tax shall be deducted at
higher rate, in accordance with provisions of section 200A44;
(iv) where tax is collectible at source under Chapter XVII-BB in case of such person, such tax shall be
collected at higher rate, in accordance with provisions of section 206CC.
(4) The provisions of sub-rule (3) shall have effect from the date* specified by the Board.
(5) The Principal Director General of Income-tax (Systems) or Director General of Income-tax (Systems)
shall specify the formats and standards along with the procedure for verifving the operational status of
permanent account number under sub-rule (1) and sub-rule (2)]

about:blank



11/1/23, 11:09 AM Income Tax Department

Income Tax Department

Government of India

Requirement to furnish Permanent Account Number.

206AA. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provisions of this Act, any person entitled to
receive any sum or income or amount, on which tax is deductible under Chapter XVIIB (hereafter referred to
as deductee) shall furnish his Permanent Account Number to the person responsible for deducting such tax

(hereafter referred to as deductor), failing which tax shall be deducted at the higher of the following rates,
namely:—

(/) at the rate specified in the relevant provision of this Act; or

(i0) at the rate or rates in force; or

(iii) at the rate of twenty per cent:
Provided that where the tax is required to be deducted under section 194-O, the provisions of clause (iii)
shall apply as if for the words "twenty per cent", the words "five per cent" had been substituted:
£ [Provided further that where the tax is required to be deducted under section 194Q, the provisions of
clause (iii) shall apply as if for the words "twenty per cent", the words "five per cent” had been substituted. ]

(2) No declaration under sub-section (1) or sub-section (1A) or sub-section (1C) of section 197A shall be
valid unless the person furnishes his Permanent Account Number in such declaration.

(3) In case any declaration becomes invalid under sub-section (2), the deductor shall deduct the tax at source
in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1).

(4) No certificate under section 197 shall be granted unless the application made under that section contains
the Permanent Account Number of the applicant.

(5) The deductee shall furnish his Permanent Account Number to the deductor and both shall indicate the
same in all the correspondence, bills, vouchers and other documents which are sent to cach other.

(6) Where the Permanent Account Number provided to the deductor is invalid or does not belong to the
deductee, it shall be deemed that the deductee has not furnished his Permanent Account Number to the
deductor and the provisions of sub-section (1) shall apply accordingly.

(7) The provisions of this section shall not apply to a non-resident, not being a company, or to a foreign
company, in respect of—

(7) payment of interest on long-term bonds as referred to in section 194L.C; and

(if) any other payment subject to such conditions as may be prescribedZ2.

about:blank



11/1/23, 11:09 AM Income Tax Department

Income Tax Department

Government of India

Requirement to furnish Permanent Account number by collectee.

206CC. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provisions of this Act, any person paying any
sum or amount, on which tax is collectible at source under Chapter XVII-BB (herein referred to as collectec)
shall furnish his Permanent Account Number to the person responsible for collecting such tax (herein referred
to as collector), failing which tax shall be collected at the higher of the following rates, namely:—

(7) at twice the rate specified in the relevant provision of this Act; or
(ii) at the rate of five per cent:

2rprovided that the rate of tax collection at source under this section shall not exceed twenty er cent.
'y P

(2) No declaration under sub-scction (1A) of section 206C shall be valid unless the person furnishes his
Permanent Account Number in such declaration.

(3) In case any declaration becomes invalid under sub-section (2), the collector shall collect the tax at source
in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1).

(4) No certificate under sub-section (9) of section 206C shall be granted unless the application made under
that section contains the Permanent Account Number of the applicant.

(5) The collectee shall furnish his Permanent Account Number to the collector and both shall indicate the
same in all the correspondence, bills, vouchers and other documents which are sent to each other.

(6) Where the Permanent Account Number provided to the collector is invalid or does not belong to the
collectee, it shall be deemed that the collectee has not furnished his Permanent Account Number to the
collector and the provisions of sub-section (1) shall apply accordingly.

(7) The provisions of this section shall not apply to a non-resident who does not have permanent
establishment in India.

Explanation—Yor the purposes of this sub-section, the expression "permanent establishment” includes a
fixed place of business through which the business of the enterprise is wholly or partly carried on.

about:blank



